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Abstract

Purpose: This paper is aimed at analyzing one component of private savings and its factors, namely the 
savings of private profit companies. 

Methodology: An analysis was conducted of the savings of the private profit companies in Bosnia and 
Herzegovina (BiH), which, viewed as the sum of savings and time deposits, recorded a cumulative growth 
of 78.72% until the outbreak of the global financial crisis. In order to examine what factors favored such 
positive developments the ARDL methodology was applied. 

Results: The variables that statistically significantly affect the savings of private profit companies in BiH are 
GDP growth rate, deposit interest rate, money supply in % of GDP and current account balance in % of GDP 
(marginally significant at 6% significance level).

Conclusion: The methodology applied confirmed the hypothesis of the paper, which proposes that the sav-
ings of private profit companies in BiH are significantly influenced by variables of the financial type.

Keywords: Savings of private profit companies, private profit companies’ savings factors, ARDL methodology

1.	 Introduction

A country’s savings rate is defined as the amount of 
funds or income generated in a particular economy 
over a period of time (usually a period of one year) 
that was not immediately utilized but allowed to be 
used in such a way to increase the returns of the ob-
served economy in the years to come. Private saving 

is a part of income that is left unspent, thus leaving 
the income circle for future consumption (Mankiw, 
2007). In this paper, the focus will be on the savings 
of private profit companies, although some empiri-
cal studies do not distinguish between household 
savings and savings of private profit companies. 
The basic determinants of private profit companies’ 
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savings will be explored, following their trends in 
the period 2000q1 – 2016q3 in Bosnia and Herze-
govina, based on key theoretical and empirical de-
terminants of saving, while examining the maturity 
impact of certain determinants.

Banks play a central role in the financial markets of 
BiH, so bank deposits appear instead of investing 
in the capital market as the most common form of 
savings. If the BiH capital market were more devel-
oped, in the sense that the government issues secu-
rities for infrastructure, holding bonds of this kind 
would be more profitable than demand deposits 
because it would bring higher interest rates.

Savings and time deposits of private profit compa-
nies in BiH had seen the highest growth since 2005 
until the last quarter of 2008 and the onset of the 
global financial crisis. The cumulative growth of de-
posits in the observed period amounted to 78.72%. 
The decline in savings and time deposits of private 
profit companies was recorded by the end of 2010. 
Savings and term deposits of private profit compa-
nies were increasing gradually and slightly in the 
period 2010-2016, but with constant fluctuations as 
a result of various changes.

The aim of this paper is to investigate what fac-
tors favor such trends in saving, and determine the 
term effect of these factors on the savings of private 
profit companies in BiH. In order to achieve the 
defined goal of the research, variables suggested by 
economic theoretical and empirical literature that 
were available for BiH were included in the model. 
All variables are expressed in relative terms, as a 
percentage of GDP.

In line with the research objective, the research hy-
pothesis was defined as follows: H1: The savings of 
private profit companies in BiH are determined by 
financial factors.

The Autoregressive Distributed Lag Model (ARDL) 
methodology, which is implemented in three steps, 
was used to test the defined hypothesis. The first 
step is to determine the existence of a long-term 
relationship between the variables by calculating 
the F-bounds test. The second step is choosing the 
right number of lags, and the third step involves 
reparameterizing the selected ARDL model into 
the Error Correction model (ECM). Previously, the 
stationarity of variables was examined by changing 
the Augmented Dickey-Fuller test (ADF), the Phil-
lips-Perron test (PP) and the Kwiatkowski-Phillips-
Schmidt-Shin test (KPSS).

The paper is structured in five parts. Following the 
introductory remarks, a review of the literature is 
given, with particular emphasis on scientific arti-
cles dealing with the issue of savings factors, bear-
ing in mind that basic economic theory recognizes 
income as the dominant savings factor. The most 
important part of the paper is an overview of the 
empirical results. This section first presents the re-
search methodology followed by model evaluation 
and analysis. Finally, concluding considerations are 
provided with concise research findings.

2.	 Theoretical framework

The main theories of saving are the permanent in-
come hypothesis and the life cycle hypothesis. The 
first suggests that income is the dominant factor, 
while the second emphasizes the significance of de-
mographic savings factors as well.

Empirical studies in this area recognize a large 
number of savings factors, but there are no unam-
biguous estimates of the absolute and maturity ef-
fects of particular savings factors.

In most savings studies, inflation is used as a com-
mon measure of future uncertainty. According to 
buffer stock theories of saving, greater uncertainty 
also means greater savings because individuals who 
are not risk averse in this period save money due to 
caution. Empirical analysis shows a positive effect 
of inflation on savings, both because of the creation 
of a precautionary motive, but also because infla-
tion is linked to income growth in the expansion-
ary phase of the business cycle. By analyzing the 
determinants of saving in Pakistan, Chaudhry et al. 
(2014) confirm that inflation has a significant posi-
tive impact on saving (both in the short and long 
term). Inflation also raises nominal interest rates, 
generating higher income and further savings. 
However, Loayza et al. (2000) find that if the inter-
est rate is not adaptable to changes in the inflation 
rate, then rising inflation will reduce the real inter-
est rate and further discourage saving in the form of 
financial assets. Kolasa and Liberda (2015) also find 
that consumer price growth is a positive function of 
saving. Inflation and the amount of money supply 
(M2) will be included in the model of this research.

Central government policy can have an impact on 
saving in various forms. The effect can be achieved 
through fiscal policy provisions, but also through 
public saving itself, which is a significant implica-
tion of Keynesian  theory. Neoclassical life-cycle 
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models show that reducing government savings 
means increasing consumption and further reduc-
ing aggregate savings, shifting tax burdens from 
present to future generations. In contrast, Keynes-
ian model argues that larger aggregate savings tem-
porarily reduce public savings. Ricardian theory 
holds that the growth of public savings does not 
have a significant impact on total national savings. 
That author argues that the growth of public sav-
ings leads to a decrease in the private savings by the 
same amount. A large number of empirical papers 
are exploring this topic.

Shaikh and Sheikh (2013) and Esmail (2014) argue 
that high government spending has the effect of 
reducing savings, especially when expressed in the 
form of external debt growth. The rigorously de-
fined postulates of Ricardian theory have been re-
futed by Ozcan et al. (2003). Based on empirical re-
search, the authors conclude that public saving does 
not tend to “squeeze out” private saving. Chaudhry 
et al. (2014), using the ARDL and the ECM meth-
odology, show that budget deficits have a negative 
impact on savings both in the long and short term. 
The authors point out that budget revenues are a 
negative function of savings in the short term, but 
a positive function in the long term. Based on the 
model outlined in this paper, the central govern-
ment revenues, expenditures and fiscal balance, as 
well as external debt will be included as variables.

Export-import price index ratios and current ac-
count balances/deficits, often referred to as external 
variables, can have a significant impact on savings in 
open economies, regardless of their level of devel-
opment. The analysis of the causality of saving and 
the relationship between export and import price 
indices is further stimulated by Harberger–Laurs-
en–Metzler hypothesis. The hypothesis argues that 
a deterioration in the export-import price index 
ratio leads to a decrease in income and savings. 
Empirical studies have shown that improving the 
relationship between export and import price indi-
ces leads to an increase in savings due to the posi-
tive impact on income and wealth. Kwakwa (2013) 
finds the positive impact of the export-import price 
index on savings both in the long and short term. 
It is usually expected that a current account deficit 
will cause a partial reduction in private savings. The 
reason for this is that external savings tend to sub-
stitute for domestic ones. Loayza et al. (2000) show 
that an increase in the current account deficit leads 
to a decrease in domestic savings, which is substi-

tuted by external savings. Ayalew (2013) establishes 
the statistical insignificance of this variable in the 
long run. The export/import price index ratio and 
the current account balance/deficit will be included 
in the model of this survey.

The interest rate is the most significant “auxiliary” 
variable in the theory of permanent income. The 
interest rate can have an effect on saving in differ-
ent ways. On the one hand, there is a substitution 
effect. In line with the substitution effect, the rise 
in the interest rate increases the cost of current ver-
sus future consumption causing savings to rise, so 
savings appear as a substitute for current consump-
tion.

On the other hand, an income effect may occur. Ac-
cording to the income effect, rising interest rates 
may discourage savings as a result of the desire to 
receive an equal amount of money in the coming 
period. The income effect also results in a reduction 
in public savings in countries with high public debt.

The sign and the magnitude of the interest rate 
impact on savings may be different, as explained 
above. Certain empirical studies highlight the posi-
tive effects of interest rates on savings. By apply-
ing the ARDL and ECM methodologies, Chaudhry 
et al. (2014) prove that higher interest rates mean 
greater savings. This methodology has made it pos-
sible to prove the significance of the effect of inter-
est rates on savings both in the long and short term.

Other studies highlight the negative effect of inter-
est rates on savings. Thanoon and Baharumshah 
(2005) argue that interest rates in the short term 
have a negative impact on savings in Latin Ameri-
can countries. The authors applied the unit root 
test as a methodology. Kolasa and Liberda (2015) 
use regression to determine the negative impact 
of the interest rate on savings in Poland, while for 
the OECD countries it has a weak positive impact. 
Several analyses have found that interest rates do 
not have a significant impact on savings. One such 
study is Bhandari et al. (2007). Given that interest 
rate is a significant determinant of savings accord-
ing to most studies, it is included as a variable in the 
model of this research.

Another variable that is included in the model is 
the unemployment rate. In BiH, the unemployment 
rate was quite high in the post-war period, which 
has had significant consequences on the overall 
national economy. In the research model, the un-
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employment rate as a variable is included by Athu-
korala and Tsai (2003).

A large number of studies highlight the importance 
of demographic saving factors. However, for BiH, 
these data are not available in a sufficiently long 
time series to satisfy the basic statistical conditions 
for sample size. Therefore, these variables are not 
included in the model.

It can be seen from the above literature review that 
there is no strictly established order of significance 
and the degree of influence of certain determinants 
on savings. The impact depends on the cultural and 
political characteristics of individual economies, 
population, experience, but also on the methodol-
ogy used. This paper will apply the initial way of ob-
serving variables, which is the relative ratio to GDP.

3.	 Research methodology

When using economic indicators in the form of 
time series, seasonal adjustments should be made 
first to exclude the effect of the season. Seasonal ad-
justment of the data should be done as the total var-
iation of the time series is significantly determined 
by seasonal variations of the series. A large variance, 
a prognostic error, occurs when the importance of 
seasonal impacts is neglected, so seasonal adjust-
ment of data is necessary. When applying seasonal 
adjustment methods, attention is focused only on 
the estimation and elimination of seasonal effects, 
no analysis is performed of the causes of seasonal 
phenomena nor are they explained.

Seasonal adjustment of the data in this paper was 
carried out using the X-13 ARIMA and the TREA-
MO SEATS methodology. The X-13 ARIMA meth-
odology provides a number of options for creating 
time series that meet the criteria of the regARIMA 
model. RegARIMA models are regression mod-
els with ARIMA errors. In these models, the main 
function of the time series is expressed by a linear 
combination of regressors, and the covariance of the 
string structure is the ARIMA process. If the regres-
sors are shut down, then the regARIMA model is 
reduced to the ARIMA model, so the main function 
is assumed to be zero. The TRAMO/SEATS method 
for seasonal adjustment of batches is also frequently 
recommended in the literature. The biggest ad-
vantage of the TRAMO/SEATS method is its suf-
ficient reliability in detailed analyses. The TRAMO 
program or the first phase of the method is used to 
pre-adjust the series. Here, workday adjustment is 

based on a regression model. In the pre-adjustment 
phase, the extremes and oulier in the series are also 
observed. In the second phase of the method, sea-
sonal adjustment of the series is carried out.

For the purposes of further econometric analysis 
after seasonally adjusted data, it is necessary to 
examine the stationarity of the variables involved. 
Stationarity is one of the most important features 
of the time series and a prerequisite for determin-
ing most econometric models. A stochastic proce-
dure is stationary unless the probable properties of 
the observed process change over time. The testing 
of the data for stationarity in this paper is done by 
applying: the ADF test, the PP test and the KPSS 
test. The null hypothesis for the ADF and PP tests 
is process nonstationarity, while the null hypothesis 
for the KPSS test is the stationarity of the process 
and serves as a confirmatory analysis for the previ-
ous tests.

The ARDL methodology was applied in determin-
ing the factors affecting the saving of private profit 
companies in BiH. The ARDL methodology can be 
applied regardless of whether the variables are I (0), 
I (1) or a combination of these differences. Unlike 
the Johansen approach, this methodology provides 
for the identification of cointegration equations. 
Each variable is an individual equation for a long-
term relationship. Once one cointegration equation 
is determined, the ARDL model of the cointegra-
tion vector is reparameterized into the EC model. 
The reparameterization procedure ensures the 
identification of short-term dynamics and long-
term relationships among the variables in the ob-
served model. Reparameterization is possible since 
the ARDL dynamic equation of the model is of the 
same form as the ECM. Unrestricted displacements 
of the regressors in the regression equation are al-
lowed through distributed displacement models. 
The ARDL methodology is implemented in three 
steps. The first step is to determine the existence 
of a long-term relationship between the variables 
by calculating the F-bounds test. The second step 
is choosing the right number of lags, while the third 
step is to reparameterize the selected ARDL model 
to the ECM model.

Two software programs were used to implement 
the ARDL methodology: EViews 9.5 and R with 
numerous packages created for time series analysis.

The literature review mentioned the variables that 
will be included in the model. The savings of pri-
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vate profit companies in % of GDP will be used as 
the dependent variable and GDP growth rates, in-
flation, general government revenues in % of GDP, 
general government expenditures in % of GDP, fis-
cal balance in % of GDP, money supply (M2) in % of 
GDP, current account balance in % of GDP, external 
debt in % of GDP, export-import price index ratio, 
deposit interest rate and unemployment rate will be 
used as independent variables. All data on variables 
for the period 2000q1 - 2016q3 are taken from the 
databases and bulletins of the Central Bank of BiH 
and the Agency for Statistics of BiH.

4.	 Research results

The results of the stationarity tests of the variables 
will be presented first, followed by the evaluation 
and analysis of the defined model using the ARDL 
methodology.

4.1	 Results of unit root tests in seasonally adjusted 
time series

The ADF test and the PP test were used to test the 
hypothesis that seasonally adjusted variables have 
unit roots. In both tests, as pointed out earlier, the 
null hypothesis is that the variable has a unit root. 
The PP test has an advantage over other unit root 

tests because it does not require the inclusion of 
additional dependent variables, as is the case with 
most other tests. An added benefit of the PP test 
is that it is not based on the assumption of a func-
tional form of error variables because it is a non-
parametric test.

The KPSS test was also used in the analysis. As point-
ed out, the null hypothesis of the KPSS test is that the 
series is stationary. Given that unit root tests have 
poor power in small samples, i.e., short time series, 
to test the robustness of the results, the results for 
the three stationarity tests are shown below.

In the ADF test, the Schwarz criteria were used to 
determine the number of lags. The PP test and the 
KPSS test used a spectral evaluation model with 
Bartlett core and Newey-West bandwidth.

The three-unit root tests do not give clear results. 
The decision on which order of integration is vari-
able is based on the results of the tests, but also on 
the visual revision of the time series chart. Such a 
combined approach has also been proposed in the 
literature due to the low power of unit root tests in 
the time series lengths available in this analysis. The 
general impression is that, overwhelmingly, there is 
a match between the flow of time series on its chart 
and the results of the tests.

Table 1 Summary of unit root test results - integration order (seasonally adjusted time series as a per-
centage of nominal gross domestic product)

Variable ADF PP KPSS Comment

Saving of private profit companies I(0) I(0) I(0) Stationary

Gross domestic product growth Rate I(0) I(0) I(0) Stationary

Inflation I(0) I(0) I(0) Stationary 

General government revenue I(1) I(0) I(1) First-order nonstationary

General government expenditure I(0) I(0) I(1) Stationary

The fiscal balance I(0) I(0) I(0) Stationary

Money supply (M2) I(1) I(1) I(1) First-order nonstationary

Current account balance I(1) I(1) I(1) First-order nonstationary

External debt I(1) I(0) I(0) Stationary

Export-import price index ratio I(0) I(0) I(0) Stationary

Deposit interest rate I(1) I(1) I(1) First-order nonstationary

Unemployment rate I(1) I(1) I(0) First-order nonstationary

Source: Author

When deciding about the order of integration of a 
particular variable, an extended model, which in-

cludes a constant and a trend, was considered first. 
Next, it was determined in an iterative procedure, 
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according to the methodology developed by End-
ers, whether the variable has a unit root or not.

The decision about the order of integration of the 
variables was made on the basis of a model that 
includes a constant and a trend, not in a direct 
way but by using the Enders process. In order to 
analyze the autoregressive models of distributed 
displacements it is important to point out that all 
variables are either stationary or first order inte-

grated variables. For these models, the require-
ment is that none of the variables is an I (2) vari-
able.

4.2	 Model estimation by the ARDL methodology

The F-bounds test was used to test the existence of 
long-term inter-series connectivity before evaluat-
ing the ARDL economy savings model. The results 
of the F-bounds test are given in Table 2.

Table 2 F-bounds and t-bounds tests

F-bounds test t-bounds test

Value Significance I(0) I(1) Value Significance I(0) I(1)

6.46 10% 2.68 3.53 -4.47 10% -2.57 -3.66

5% 3.05 3.97 5% -2.86 -3.99

2.5% 3.40 4.36 2.5% -3.13 -4.26

1% 3.81 4.92 1% -3.43 -4.60

Note: The null hypothesis is that there is no correlation between levels of series. 
Source: Author

The F-statistic value in the F-bounds test is 6.46 and 
exceeds even the 1% critical value for the upper lim-
it (4.92). Therefore, there is more than enough evi-
dence to reject the null hypothesis, which proposes 
that there is no long-term dependence among the 
variables in the ARDL model. In other words, this 
test confirmed the long-term interdependence 
among the variables involved.

Since the long-term interdependence is confirmed, in 
the next two steps, the number of lags of each variable 
in the ARDL model is determined and then the ARDL 
model is evaluated with a certain number of lags.

The number of lags in the model was determined 
using the Schwarz criterion. Using this test, the 
ARDL (2,1,2,0,0) model was selected. In doing so, 
starting from the preliminary specification of a 
model of 10 independent variables, the list of vari-
ables included in the ARDL model was reduced us-
ing statistical tests.

Specifically, when specifying the ARDL model, not 
all independent variables had a statistically signifi-
cant effect on the dependent variable. The estima-
tion using the ARDL model, with the saving of pri-
vate profit companies in % of GDP as a dependent 
variable, included the following independent vari-
ables: growth rate of real gross domestic product, 
money supply (M2) in % of GDP, deposit rate and 
current account balance in % of GDP.

The ARDL model estimate is given in Table 3. The 
upper part of the table contains the coefficients of 
the long-term savings participation ratio of GDP 
and other model variables. The bottom of Table 3 
contains the results of the error correction model, 
i.e., the coefficients of the interdependence of the 
savings ratio in GDP and other variables of the 
model in the short term.

Long-term interdependence ratios are all statisti-
cally significantly different from zero, although the 
ratio of the current account balance to GDP is mar-
ginally significant at 6% significance level.

All coefficients have the expected sign. The negative 
coefficient along with the growth rate of the real gross 
domestic product suggests that faster growth of the do-
mestic product did not have a positive effect on the in-
crease in the private profit companies’ savings share in 
gross domestic product in the long run. In other words, 
savings grew more slowly than domestic product.

A one percent increase in the share of money sup-
ply (M2) in gross domestic product will, in the long 
run, lead to a 0.15% increase in the share of private 
profit companies’ savings in gross domestic prod-
uct. The larger amount of money in circulation 
in the long run also increases the level of savings. 
The positive impact of M2 is in line with previous 
empirical studies: Park and Shin (2009), Sahoo and 
Dash (2013), Bayar (2014).
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A one-percent increase in the deposit interest rate 
in GDP will, in the long run, lead to a 1.2% increase 
in the share of private profit companies’ savings 

in GDP. The positive effect of deposit interest rate 
on savings was also found by Nicholas (2007), 
Chaudhry et al. (2014).

Table 3 The ARDL model

Long term

Variable Coefficient t-statistics p-value

GDP growth rate -0.5332 -2.61 0.0131

Money supply (M2) in % GDP 0.1506 5.47 0.0000

Deposit interest rate 1.1961 2.48 0.0182

Current account balance in % GDP 0.1071 1.94 0.0606

@Trend -0.3235 -6.90 0.0000

Short term

Constant -6.0224 -5.87 0.0000

∆ Savings of private profit companies in % GDP (-1) 0.4441 3.54 0.0011

∆ Growth rate of real gross domestic product -0.1303 -3.50 0.0013

∆ Money supply (M2) in % GDP 0.0483 3.30 0.0022

∆ Money supply (M2) in % GDP (-1) -0.0940 -4.89 0.0000

Error correction (EC) (-1) -0.4658 -5.89 0.0000

Determination coefficient R2 0.6762

Adjusted coefficient of determination 0.6358

F-statistics 16.71

Breusch-Godfrey autocorrelation LM test 5.5144 (number of lags = 4), p-value = 0.2385

Jarque-Bera normality test 2.7625 (degrees of freedom = 2), p-value = 0.2513

Ramsey RESET functional form test 0.9909 (degrees of freedom = 2, 33), p-value = 0.3820

ARCH test 5.4997 (number o = f lags 4), p-value = 0.2398

White heteroskedasticity test 5.8365 (degrees of freedom = 10), p-value = 0.8288

Note: The null hypothesis for the Breusch-Godfrey LM autocorrelation test is that model residuals are not autocorrela-
ted; The null hypothesis for the Jarque-Bera normality test is that model residuals follow a normal distribution; The null 
hypothesis for the Ramsey RESET test is that the functional form of the model is correctly specified; The null hypothe-
sis for the White heteroskedasticity test is that the model residuals are homoskedastic.
Source: Author

The error correction coefficient (EC (-1)) in the 
short-term part of the model, which measures the 
rate of equilibrium adjustment in the dynamic 
model, has the expected negative sign and is statis-
tically significant. Its value of -0.4658 indicates that 
deviations from the long-term savings rate, i.e., the 
share of private profit companies’ savings in gross 
domestic product in the current period/quarter, 
are adjusted by 46.58% in the next period/quarter. 
Based on this coefficient, we calculate how many 
quarters it takes to fully adjust: 1/0.4658 * 4 = 8.6 
quarters, that is, it takes eight and a half quarters 

for the private profit companies’ savings rate to 
fully match the deviations from the long-term sav-
ings rate.

All short-term coefficients are expected to be small-
er than the corresponding long-term coefficients, 
suggesting that only part of the equilibrium devia-
tion adjustment is performed in the short term, that 
is, adjustment requires longer than one quarter.

To test the individual significance of the coefficients 
in the ARDL models, we use the values ​​based on 
the t-bounds test in Table 2. Based on the previous 
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results, which suggest that the deposit interest rate 
and money supply (M2) have the dominant statis-
tically significant influence on private profit com-
panies’ savings in BiH, we confirm the hypothesis 
of this paper, which proposes that the savings of 
private profit companies in BiH are determined by 
financial factors.

The validity of the ARDL model was evaluated us-
ing a set of statistical tests, whose results are shown 
in the lower part of Table 3. All statistical diagnostic 
tests of the evaluated model indicate that the ARDL 
model is correctly specified.

The Breusch-Godfrey autocorrelation LM test indi-
cates that the model results are not autocorrelated. 
The ARCH test and the White heteroskedasticity 
test confirm that the model residuals are homoske-
dastic and uncorrelated with independent model 
variables. The Jarque-Bera normality test indicates 
the normal layout of the model residuals, while the 
Ramsey RESET functional form test confirms the 
correct specification of the model.

The relatively high value of the adjusted coefficient 
of determination, 0.6358, suggests that nearly 64% 
of the variation in the private profit companies’ sav-
ings rate is explained by variations in the set of in-
dependent variables included in this ARDL model.

5.	 Discussion

The variables that statistically significantly affect the 
savings of private profit companies in BiH are GDP 
growth rate, deposit interest rate, money supply in 
% of GDP and current account balance in % of GDP 
(marginally significant at 6% significance level).

The deposit interest rate shows a positive impact in 
the long run only on the savings of private profit 
companies in BiH. An increase in the deposit inter-
est rate of 1% causes the private profit companies 
to save 1.2%.

Analyzing monetary determinants of savings in 
Pakistan, Chaudhry et al. (2014) find that interest 
rate is a positive function of private profit compa-
nies’ savings. The authors explain these results by 
the fact that a higher deposit interest rate means 
more savings for the private profit companies be-
cause of high borrowing costs, so companies create 
their own inventories of funds in these conditions. 
In considering the determinants of savings in South 
Africa, Nicholas (2007) also found a positive effect 
of the deposit interest rate on savings. The same ef-

fect was also found by Nasir and Khalid (2004), Ah-
mad et al. (2006), Chaudhry et al. (2010).

The deposit interest rate is expected to have a posi-
tive impact on savings. Higher deposit interest rate 
causes the savings of private profit companies in 
BiH to grow, but only in the long run. This may be 
so because the interest rate on corporate deposits 
is not high enough to attract savings in the short 
term. It may also be due to the different tax burdens 
and business risks that businesses are exposed to so 
they cannot make significant savings in the short 
term even if the interest rate is high. If a favorable 
deposit interest rate and stable economic and politi-
cal developments in the long run are expected, then 
the private profit companies’ savings will increase 
with interest rates rising. The aforementioned sig-
nificant impact of the deposit interest rate on the 
private profit companies’ savings can help the mon-
etary and fiscal policy makers in BiH in formulating 
strategies and implementing economic policies.

GDP growth, both in the long and the short term, 
results in a reduction in savings. Thus, one-percent 
GDP growth will reduce private profit companies’ 
savings by 0.53% and 0.13% in the long and short 
term, respectively.

Increasing production in BiH means that business-
es need to invest more heavily in their resources 
(human and technological) and promotion because 
they operate in a poor and developing country. As a 
result, there is not enough savings available or they 
must be used for further development, so they are 
reduced both in the short and long term as produc-
tion volumes grow.

Money is expected to have a positive impact on pri-
vate profit companies’ savings in both the long and 
the short term. A one percent increase in the share 
of money supply in GDP will lead to an increase 
in the share of private profit companies’ savings in 
GDP by 0.15% in the long run, or approximately 
0.05% in the short run.

By analyzing savings in developing countries in 
Asia, Park and Shin (2009) found a positive effect of 
money supply on private profit companies’ savings. 
The same results were obtained by Horioka and Yin 
(2010), Sahoo and Dash (2013), and Bayar (2014).

More money in circulation means a more devel-
oped financial sector in the country, which increas-
es confidence in the banking sector. If this trend is 
expected to continue in the future, then savings in 
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the long run will also grow. Such developments are 
expected as more money in circulation means fast-
er capital flow and more investment, and therefore 
enough resources for private profit companies to 
save more. This reaffirms that greater confidence in 
the BiH financial sector is conducive to the growth 
of private profit companies’ savings. Therefore, the 
results obtained can also be used to inform and de-
velop an adequate economic policy in BiH.

6.	Conclusion

This paper focused on exploring the phenomenon 
of private profit companies’ savings, as one of the 
components of private savings, in the small open 
economy of Bosnia and Herzegovina over a sixteen-
year period. The theoretical and empirical literature 
does not clearly define the impact of individual fac-
tors on savings. Most studies also have a macroeco-
nomic focus on total private savings and do not dif-
ferentiate between individual categories of private 
savings, which is particularly important for small 
emerging economies. This analysis examined the 
impact of macroeconomic and financial factors on 
BiH private profit companies’ savings as a compo-
nent of private savings.

Survey results show that private profit companies’ 
savings, expressed relatively (in % of GDP) in BiH 
are determined by: GDP growth rate, deposit inter-
est rate, money supply in % of GDP and current ac-
count balance in % of GDP (marginally significant 
at 6% significance level).

The negative coefficient along with the real GDP 
growth rate suggests that faster growth of GDP 
did not have a positive effect on the increase in the 
share of private profit companies’ savings in GDP 
in the long run. In other words, savings grew more 
slowly than GDP.

A one percent increase in the share of money sup-
ply (M2) in GDP will in the long run lead to a 0.15% 
increase in the share of private profit companies’ 
savings in GDP. The larger amount of money in cir-
culation in the long run also increases the level of 
savings.

A one-percent increase in the deposit interest rate 
in GDP will in the long run lead to a 1.2% increase 
in the share of private profit companies’ savings in 
GDP.

All short-term coefficients are expected to be small-
er than the corresponding long-term coefficients, 
suggesting that only part of the equilibrium devia-
tion adjustment is performed in the short term, that 
is, adjustment requires longer than one quarter.

The main objective of the paper was to examine the 
influence of certain factors on private profit compa-
nies’ savings. The research confirmed the hypoth-
esis of the paper, namely that the saving of private 
profit companies in BiH is determined by financial 
factors.

The conducted research makes both theoretical 
and empirical contribution to the ongoing discus-
sions on this topic. The theoretical contribution is 
reflected in the development of savings models for 
BiH, since no similar research has been done so far. 
An additional theoretical contribution at a more 
“global” level consists in testing and determining 
the impact of existing theory-defined factors on 
private profit companies’ savings in small emerg-
ing economies. The empirical contribution of the 
research is that the obtained results can be used to 
inform strategic decision-making, both at the mac-
roeconomic level and at the level of commercial 
banks, where most of the private profit companies’ 
savings in BiH are realized.

The key challenge in the analysis was the limited 
availability and quality of data to conduct empirical 
research. Thus, some variables were not monitored 
for the BiH economy, whereas the variables includ-
ed also had a significant number of missing data for 
the reference period. By using the available statisti-
cal methods of imputation of missing data and by 
contacting the competent statistical and financial 
state institutions, following the procedure for ob-
taining the data that have not been made public, the 
mentioned limitations could be addressed.

In further analysis, it would be useful to carry out 
similar research after a number of years to deter-
mine if the length of the time series has affected 
the results. It would be important to include demo-
graphic data in savings models as well, which was 
not possible in this study due to the short data se-
ries. Furthermore, it would be useful to carry out 
a comparative analysis with similar economies in 
order to reach more general conclusions.
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