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Fig. 1 Church of St. Peter in Split, Andrija Mutnjaković, 1970
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Conceptual Definition  
of the Term Experimental Architecture
Ambiguity of Terminological Attributions

experimental architecture
futurist architecture
paper architecture
radical architecture
utopian architecture
visionary architecture

Academic literature lacks an unambiguous term to describe architec-
tural and urban planning projects that are borderline feasible, firmly 
bound to reality but simultaneously also liberated from it, represent-
ing an inevitable component of the development of architecture as  
a discipline. This paper analyses the most commonly used terms in 
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Introduction

 Experimental and exploratory architecture 
is pejoratively often called paper architecture 
(Armstrong, 2019: 43), and academic litera-
ture offers a variety of adjectives in attempts 
to describe it: experimental, utopian, radical, 
futurist, visionary, etc. It is, therefore, unsur-
prising that sometimes several terms are 
used in the same text:

“…Earning a reputation as innovators and vi-
sionaries, these pioneers convinced their cli-
ents that they were involved in exciting proj-
ects, and some of these practices were trans-
formed into brands. At a certain point, the 
speculative aspects of these experiments, 
which suggested ways to transforming soci-
ety by, for example, providing housing for 
workers, increasing public freedoms and fos-
tering social solidarity, became tangible and 
returned new ideas to the realm of practice.” 
(Armstrong, 2019: 6; Kaminer, 2011: ch. 6).

An example of the use of various terms to de-
scribe an architect and his work in Croatian 
architectural discourse is Andrija Mutnjako
vić, whose projects were characterized as 
visionary (Glavan, 1975: 17), and utopian 
(Pasinović, 1969: 31), while he was called a 
futurist architect (Cvetkova, 1991: 4). Mut
njaković first and foremost considered him-
self a visionary researcher, whose projects 
are a reality - it is just a question of time 
when they will be implemented (Cvetkova, 
1991: 4). However, when describing his own 
projects and those by some of his contempo-

raries, he used the unifying term experiment 
(Galović, 2014: 18).
The research addresses the problem of ter
minology in the domain of experimental ar­
chitecture, starting from the pluralism of its 
designations, used both in literature and  
in projects descriptions written by authors 
themselves. Given that experimental archi-
tecture commonly incorporates an extremely 
wide domain of social issues, the pluralism  
of its attributes, often overlapping in their 
meaning, is a logical outcome. Following that 
logic, the research attempts to distinguish 
the conceptual determinants of the used 
terms for the purpose of better understand-
ing them. The goal of the research is, there-
fore, a more precise and solid definition of 
the designator’s relationship to the architec-
tural corpus implied by its domain. On the 
one hand, this is achieved by linking the proj-
ects and their accompanying designations 
through an analysis of contextual levels with-
in which sets of projects are situated, and on 
the other hand, a cross-comparison of de-
nominators-differentiated groups. The re-
search has been carried out with regard to 
Croatian architectural practice, establishing 
its comparative relationship with the culmi-
nation of the world experimental architecture 
of the second half of the 20th century.

Experimental architecture

The term “experimental architecture” was in-
troduced in broader terms by Peter Cook in 
1970, in his book Experimental Architecture. 
At the very beginning of this work, Cook de-
bates the impossibility of comprehensive and 
simultaneous prediction of the future in a 
broader field, and thereby also the possibility 
of fruitful discourse that would be prompted 
by architectural thought or a project which 
clearly set limits on experimental architec-
ture. Experimental projects generally deal 
with one aspect or a narrow facet of the fu-
ture, while even in projects that are called 
experimental, Cook saw a major difference 
between the import of an image or form and 
the fundamental idea which precedes it. The 
discussion is dominated by a simplified view 
in which each new idea in architecture must 
result in a new form and vice versa, thus pre-
cluding any serious debate about experimen-
tal architecture, as Cook summarizes: “There 
is no real experiment, only built form which is 
unorthodox, or drawing which is unfamiliar” 
(Cook, 1970: 29).

Lebbeus Woods, an architect and founder of 
the Research Institute for Experimental Archi-
tecture, concludes with regret that experi-
mental architecture has all but disappeared. 
According to Woods, today, there is little ar-
chitecture or design that truly experiments, 
i.e., that plays with the unknown. The single 
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defining feature of an experiment is that no 
one knows what its outcome will be. The ex-
perimenter is looking for something, has a 
hypothesis to prove, but ultimately every-
thing may result in something unexpected. 
Architecture is averse to this kind of risk 

(Woods, 2015: 34).

For Rachel Armstrong, a scientist and a pio-
neer in developing design based on “living 
technologies”, experimental architecture is a 
visionary branch of architecture and a form of 
practical research. In a series of different 
projects, Armstrong explored how interdisci-
plinary experimental practice changes archi-
tecture as a profession. Designs that can be 
described as closest to the concept of experi-
mental architecture are those in which imple-
mentation entails the use or implies an inten-
tion to use new technologies and materials 
that are produced and tested, their proper-
ties observed as potential future construc-
tion materials, etc. Results of such research 
and experimentation with, for example, living 
programmable organisms that have certain 
architectural properties, become tools for 
new, similar research. For Armstrong and her 
associates, the experimental component 
largely proceeds in laboratory conditions, 
which classifies her work as an experiment 
virtually by definition. Even though results of 
these experiments are only the beginning of 
something that certainly awaits us in the fu-
ture, for now one may say that the experi-
ment mostly pertains to the discovery of  
new construction elements, which are in  
this specific case based on living organisms, 
programmable, ecological, etc. (Armstrong, 
2019: 49-50).

In the interview “Design in the Digital Age” 
(Goldberger, 2014), Rem Koolhaas states that 
architects create the uniqueness in a very 
repetitive world and that materialized archi-
tecture is always the “beta version”, pointing 
to the developmental and research compo-
nent of the discipline.

Several decades earlier, an internationally 
renowned Belgrade professor, architect, and 
theoretician Ranko Radović asserted that 
each valuable work of architecture was si-
multaneously in and of itself a sort of experi-
ment, i.e., high-risk research. Uncertainty,  
an attempt, is inherent to large-scale archi-
tecture; the wings of the new, untested, are 
visible (Radović, 1969: 25).

By definition, an experiment is a procedure 
involving controlled observation and mea-
surement of phenomena that is conducted in 
order to verify a scientific hypothesis as well 
as something that is experiential, explorato-
ry, grounded in experience, confirmed by 
testing (Anić et al., 2002: 355). Insofar as we 

should attempt to literally translate such a 
definition into the language of architecture, 
this would imply those projects that have 
nonetheless been implemented either in 
whole or in part in order to record certain ob-
servations, results or reactions. Since the 
physical implementation of experimental 
projects is generally not even contained in 
the basic idea of the project’s creation, ren-
dered designs that would correspond to this 
definition of experimental architecture are 
relatively few in number, just as their scale is 
small. Such examples are most often ephem-
eral and implemented using simple materials 
and tools. These are frequently pneumatic 
and similar constructions that are not finan-
cially demanding, so their designers were 
able to implement them on their own. Au-
thors such as Ant Farm have even published 
handbooks of a sort for constructions based 
on their own experiences and observations 
(Ant Farm, 1971). There are examples in inte-
riors, smaller residential units (domes, mod-
ules, etc.) but also at larger scales, among 
the pavilions for the World Expo, containing 
more complex structures and sizes.

An example of such an ephemeral project was 
the Oasis no. 7, installed on the façade of a 
building as part of the Documenta 5 exhibi-
tion in Kassel (Fig. 2). Like many other proj-
ects by the Austrian architectural collective 
Haus-Rucker-Co., this was also a temporary 
architectural intervention in which the basic 
element was a transparent, inflatable struc-
ture with a diameter of 8 m. Utilizing small 
scale and carefully chosen materials, this 
structure was oriented toward the bodily ex-
perience of the individual inside, and the ex-
amination of new possibilities for communi-
cation between architecture and the city and 

Fig. 2 Oasis no. 7, Haus-Rucker-Co., 1972
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citizens outside. These projects, thanks to the 
simplicity of their rendering, made it possible 
for the interaction between people and their 
environment to assume new meanings and 
alter our understanding of the physical envi-
ronment through a new sensory experience.

Another project that emerged as a genuine 
experiment related to the context of Croatian 
architectural practice was the Synthetic 
House by Juraj Neidhardt in 1966. This project 
constituted an attempt to respond to the high 
demand for new housing units by means of 
inexpensive production of prefabricated indi-
vidual family homes with the aid of the “ma-
terial of the future” (polyester). In the execu-
tion of his idea, Neidhardt sought the assis-
tance of the Materials and Construction 
Testing Institute in Sarajevo and the Con-
struction Institute in Zagreb. The elements 
were crafted and tested in Zagreb (Fig. 3). 
Neidhardt himself confirmed that this was 
truly an experiment when he said: “…If this 
campaign succeeds…” - clearly indicating 
that the outcome was uncertain, and added 
that: “This will, however, require much more 
persistence and experimentation” (Neidhardt, 
1966: 4).

Starting from opposite premises, yet both ex-
perimental in essence, projects Oasis no.7 
and the Synthetic House illustrate the broad 
domain of the concept of architectural exper-
imentation.

Utopian architecture

Another oft-used term is utopian architecture 
or utopian project. The term “utopia” desig-
nates any unattainable idea, dream, fancy or 
aspiration to overcome actual reality and 
build a new, ideally conceived reality from in-
dividual elements. Furthermore, utopias are 
distinguished from unrealistic efforts (fanta-

sies) by the logical tie between actual phe-
nomena, causes, conditions and constants 
(Grubiša, Tatarin, 2015). The term’s definition 
points to the conclusion that the achieve-
ment of utopian projects is impossible.

The view that the realization of utopias is im-
possible is also shared by the sociologist R. 
Levitas, an important researcher of utopias. 
She observes that a colloquially understood 
utopia contains two meanings: a good, but 
non-existent and therefore impossible, soci-
ety. In the same book, she further observes 
that many problems which beset utopian 
scholars arise from the absence of a clear 
definition of the term which would separate 
its specialist academic use from the mean-
ings present in everyday language (Levitas, 
1991: 2).

Utopias foresee improved living conditions 
which should replace the current ones, which 
is why their concern is narrowly linked not 
only to the future, but also ensues from the 
present and past. Given their ties to past 
events and places, as well as the present 
ones, and the attempt to respond to them, 
this is a far more complex process than the 
conventional view of utopia as the simple in-
vention of a “new approach” (Coleman, 
2007: ch.2,11). That the term utopian is un-
derstood very broadly is confirmed by R. Mar-
tin who talks about “ghosts” or outlines of 
utopia, seeing utopia as an event; recurring 
historically as a thought rather than as a 
thing, a place, or even an ideal (Singh, Mar-
tin, 2013: 80). Spanish architect Miguel Fis-
sac considered architectural utopia a source 
of creativity, but with the caveat that an ar-
chitectural utopia must follow an authentic 
orthogenesis like any project that shall be 
implemented tomorrow (Fissac, 1975: 14). 
Thus, in his view the utopian project is one 
for which there is no intention of realization.

In his book Hrvatska arhitektura dvadesetog 
stoljeća - Neostvareni projekti [Croatian Ar-
chitecture of the 20th Century - Unbuilt Proj-
ects], Croatian architect and theorist Tomis-
lav Odak called Le Corbusier’s Plan Voisin an 
urban planning/architectural utopia that Le 
Corbusier himself never believed would be 
realized (Odak, 2006: 12). In the book Uto­
pijske vizije arhitekture grada [Utopian Vi-
sions of the Architecture of the City] by Croa-
tian architect Ivan Juras, most designs are 
unrealized projects, demonstrating that for 
that author, the concept of utopian is closely 
linked to the unbuilt (Juras, 1997). With the 
passage of time, from the moment they 
emerge, projects are more easily declared 
utopian, such as, for example, the Synthur-
banism by Croatian architect Vjenceslav Rich-
ter (Fig. 4), which belongs to the group of 
techno-utopian urbanisms or urban utopias 

(Kulić, Mrduljaš, 2017: 120). However, Richter 

Fig. 3 Synthetic house, Juraj Neidhardt, 1966
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himself insisted on the opposite, and he only 
expressed his suspicion in the feasibility - and 
only temporary so - in the subsequent phase 
of Synthurbanism with rotating ziggurats in 
the Heliopolis project (Richter, 2016: 24).

The opposite of utopia is dystopia, so when 
interpreting his vision for the city of the future, 
“Ecumenopolis”, Constantinos Doxiadis drew 
a distinction between the concept of utopia as 
a non-place and eutopia (or more precisely 
eftopia) as a good place, with dystopia on the 
other side of the spectrum, as a bad or dread-
ful place (Doxiadis, 1968: 32-33).

Besides the concept of utopian architecture, it 
is essential to mention the ideal city as a sort 
of an attempt to implement the utopian idea  
of an ideal society in a physical framework 
(Fig. 5; Mutnjaković, 2003: 232). The combina-
tion of utopia and the ideal city have resulted 
in models of cities that, even today, we look up 
to with awe (Rowe, Koetter, 2003: 14).

Radical projects

Radical implies indispensable and thorough 
changes (Anić et al., 2002: 1202), so even in 

architecture we come across terms such as: 
radical urban visions (Kulić, Mrduljaš, 2017: 
120) for Vjenceslav Richter’s project Synthur-
banism, which utilizes means and proposals 
significantly different from customary urban 
planning practices. Architects who re-exam-
ine existing conventions and offer radical so-
lutions assume a special place in the history 
of contemporary architecture, and exhibi-
tions such as “Radical Architects, 1960-75” 
have been organized (Dellale, 1996: 54).

Lebbeus Woods wrote about how the term 
radical once referred to paradigm shifts and 
important changes in theory and practice 
that contributed to human progress but is to-
day associated with various extremist (terror-
ist) movements that undermine the social 
order. Architecture, as one of the instruments 
that reinforces the social order, thus loses 
the possibility of proposing radical programs 
and modes of use, while radical forms are as 
always welcome (Woods, 2015: 33).

In architecture, the term radical is associated 
with the late 1960s and groups such as Archi-
gram from London and Archizoom and Super-
studio from Florence, as representatives of 

Fig. 4 Synthurbanism, Vjenceslav Richter, 1964
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Radical Design. The Radical Design Move-
ment exhibited a desire similar to Specula-
tive Design, representing a vision of a possi-
ble future as a means of criticism and provo-
cation. They perhaps differed with regard to 
their motivation. Radical design wanted to 
break with the past, while speculative design 
demonstrates a more critical stance, present 
in its visions of projected futures (Smyth, Au-
ger, Helgason, 2021: 24).

Speculative projects

What all of the thus far considered projects 
and the various designations that character-
ize them have in common is that they foresee 
a specific future and offer solutions in the 
form of projects in line with their postulates. 
However, predictions of the future have al-
most as a rule been proven inaccurate, par-
ticularly with regard to technology. Today, 
the term speculative is generally associated 
with design which uses visions of potential 
futures as tools to better understand the 
present and debate versions of the future 
that people want and those that people do 
not want (Dunne, Raby, 2013: 2). Even though 
the aforementioned architects, gathered in 
Archigram, Superstudio and Archizoom, op-
erated for a relatively brief period, the radical 
architectural speculation by these teams is 
today becoming ever more relevant (Smyth 
et al., 2021: 24).

Visionary projects

Visionary projects are by definition classified 
in the speculative group because they imply 
a certain living notion of what should happen 
or be created. In the figurative sense, this is a 
conceived or foreseen objective that the indi-
vidual or group intends to achieve in the fu-
ture (*** 2021). If the definition is considered 
exclusively through the prism of the feasibil-
ity of implementation, then in architecture 
this would cover projects that could not be 
carried forward when they were conceived 

due to technological, political, economic or 
some other reasons, but were implemented 
as a whole or in part subsequently, when the 
necessary conditions were met. An older ex-
ample that corresponds to such a notion of 
visionary architecture is the Ideal City (Func-
tional City) in two levels by Leonardo da Vinci 
from 1488, in which canal transport for the 
populace and craftsmen would be divided 
from roads for the nobility, a sewage system 
would be introduced, etc. In other words, he 
quite ingeniously anticipated traffic segre
gation in the cities of the future (Radović, 
1969: 25). As under current conditions crite-
ria for the feasibility of implementation are 
no longer dictated as much by technology,  
it is other factors, economic or social, that 
determine what is visionary or not (Drexler, 
1963: 4).

In Croatian architecture, one of the oft-cited 
examples of a visionary project is the Out-
door and Indoor Swimming Facility on the 
site of Delta in Rijeka by Vladimir Turina, Ivan 
Seifert, Ninoslav Kučan and Zvonimir Radić 
from 1948 (Kovač et al., 2020: 330). Even 
though it was conceived as a theoretical proj-
ect (Čerina et al., 1997: 71), it was elaborated 
in great detail, foreseeing what were at the 
time non-existent technologies that are to-
day standard in construction. A lesser known 
example is the design for the Church of St. 
Peter in Split from 1974 by Andrija Mutnja
ković which, according to the architect, came 
near implementation in 1980 for the needs  
of the Olympics in the then socialist Soviet 
Union, albeit no longer as a church, but rath-
er a cultural hall (Fig. 1; Čerina, 2021).

Futurist projects, or projects  
of the future

Futurist projects are essentially speculative, 
but their focus is generally future based on 
technological development and possible so-
cial changes that run parallel to technological 
progress (*** 2021). Futurist projects (Fig. 6) 

Fig. 5 Ideal city, Lucijan Vranjanin, 15th c.
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Fig. 6 Hydroid, Vojtjeh Delfin, 1966

Fig. 7 Cocoonplane, Andrija Mutnjaković, 1981

may be associated with futurology, which, 
among other things, aims at scientific predic-
tion and research into the future of the hu-
man community based on the objective facts 
of the present day, in order to deliberately, 
consciously and purposively impact humani-
ty’s future (Keller, 1973: 19).

Here a distinction should be drawn between 
futurist projects turned to the future and the 
artistic movement called Futurism from the 
onset of the 20th century, in which architec-
ture eschewed everything old while extolling 
the advancement of technology, transporta-
tion and speed and viewed cities as being in 
constant motion.

Intentional architecture

The term intentional architecture is associat-
ed with the titles of two exhibitions held in 
Wrocław, Poland, “Terra-1” in 1975 and “Ter-
ra-2” in 1981, organized by Polish architect 
Stefan Müller with the sub-title: “Internation-
al Exhibition of Intentional Architecture.” Par-
ticipants from the entire world were invited to 
the exhibition to contribute to its theme: “the 
relationship between art, science and tech-
nology as a social development factor of our 
era” (Duda, Rutkowski, 2011: 42). The term 
“intentional architecture”, which has been 
attributed to Müller, contains within itself a 
utopian component and primarily implies 
pure architecture, liberated from all mate- 
rial limitations, reduced only to ideas and 
thoughts (Lisowski, 2011). Stefan Müller 
claimed that the material limitations that ex-
ist today may not be limitations in some near 
future (Duda, Rutkowski, 2011: 43).

Andrija Mutnjaković also took part in both ex-
hibitions by invitation with the project Domo­
bil/Homobil at the first exhibition and the 
floating house project called Kokonplan/Co-
coonplane at the secondone (Mutnjaković, 
2018: 8; Fig. 7).

One may conclude that these are projects 
that do not necessarily have their point of 
departure in some common theory or orien
tation, rather they can be autonomous ar
chitectural ideas. However, even the term 
“intentional” is very broad and virtually en-
compasses every idea or project, because all 
projects are a result of the creator’s thoughts 
and intentions.

Paper architecture

Paper architecture, like the terms analysed 
previously in the text, encompasses architec-
ture that often cannot even be constructed, 
but which has always been the primary labo-
ratory of architectural thought (Blažević, 
2015). By the same token, the term paper ar-
chitecture does not mean that the medium by 

which an architectural idea is presented must 
exclusively be paper. It implies all other 
forms of presentation of theoretical texts, en-
gaged performances, campaigns, education-
al initiatives, film and video, etc. The expres-
sion paper architecture is used by many 
scholars, but perhaps the most precise defi-
nition was provided by Tahl Kaminer: “Paper 
architecture is the most explicit form of archi-
tectural autonomy, reducing architecture to 
its own medium - the drawing - and bypass-
ing the building, the end-product of design 
which does not solely depend on the archi-
tect but also the investment, engineering, 
regulations and contractors. Actually, the 
very existence of paper architecture offers 
“evidence” that architecture is not situated 
in a building itself, but rather in an idea, in a 
project.” (Kaminer, 2011: ch.1).
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Conclusion

There is no uniform term that would encom-
pass all categories of projects included in this 
overview, and frequently several terms are 
used for the same projects, particularly if 
texts by different authors are considered. The 
meaning of terms and their relationship to 
the relevant projects often overlap, while 
their use depends on the specific aspects of 
the project itself, or the problem-oriented 
discourse instigated by the project. The au-
thors of projects use different terms under 
different circumstances to describe their 
projects, or they accept terms that others 
use. Even though they use terms that under-
score the fact that the project will likely never 
be implemented, in many cases the archi-
tects believe in the force and feasibility of 
their ideas, and that which stands in the way 
of implementation is technology, money, 
politics and social will, etc.

The terms used, however, do not fall into the 
same conceptual category and the heteroge-
neity of their origin contribute to their over-
lapping meanings. While some relate to the 
nature of the proposed intervention (experi-
mental, speculative), the others enter the do-
main of the proposed content (utopian, ideal) 
or its specific characteristics (visionary, fu-
turistic). Some of the terms are institutional-
ized through recognizable gallery practices 

by which they are strongly determined (radi-
cal, intentional).
What should be considered is that the ob-
served attributes used by different authors 
could be aimed at directing the reader into 
the particular narrative of the text itself, hence 
set without a crucial critical stance toward the 
nature of the signified. Therefore, their un-
critical acceptance could be misleading. 
Merely the application of such simplified at-
tributions is insufficient for an in-depth study 
of experimental architecture, where it is nec-
essary to deeply reexamine the relationship 
between the signified and the signifier, that 
is, the characteristics inherent to the projects 
and the terms used to describe them. Further 
on, while observing Croatian experimental ar-
chitectural practices, it is necessary to con-
sider the particularities of the context within 
which they are developed, and the causes of 
their distancing from or overlapping with 
world trends. Those facts could be taken as a 
direction for further research.
The term experimental project, although it 
cannot be simply superimposed upon archi-
tecture in the sense of its definition, encom-
passes the broadest spectrum of projects be-
cause it has no ideological, temporal or other 
determinant, but rather implies architectural 
research in the broadest sense of the word.

[Translated by Projectus grupa]
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